
The 6th October, 2009.

No.HPL.136/73/390.–The following Notification issued by the Government of India, Ministry of Personnel,
Public Grievances & Pensions, (Department of Personnel, & Training), New Delhi is republished for general
information :-

Notification No.11058/02/2008-AIS.III dated the 25th August, 2009.

G.S.R. In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 of the All India Services Act,
1951 (61 of 1951), the Central Government after consultation with the Governments of the States concerned, hereby
makes the following rules further to amend the Indian Police Service (Uniform) Rules, 1954, namely :-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Indian Police Service (Uniform) Amendment Rules, 2009.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Indian Police Service (Uniform) Rules, 1954 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in sub-rule(1)
of rule 4:-

(i) for the words “six thousand five hundred”, the words “fourteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted and
shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st September, 2008;

(ii) for the words “seven years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from the 1st September, 2008;

3. In Rule 4A of the said rules, for the words “one hundred and fifty rupees”, the words “three hundred rupees” shall
be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st September, 2008.

4. Below rule 4A of the said rules, the following new rule 4B shall be added, namely :-

“4B – The rates of Uniform Allowance and Kit Maintenance Allowance for the members of the service shall be
increased by 25% every time the Dearness Allowance on revised pay bands goes up by 50%”.

[Explanatory Memorandum-Government of India’s Resolution No.1/1/2008-I.C, dated the 29th August, 2008
published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part I, Section 1, relating to implementation of the recommendation of
the Sixth Central Pay Commission provides that the revised allowances, other than dearness allowance, will be
effective from the 1st day of September, 2008. Accordingly, these rules have been made effective from the 1st
September, 2008].

(No.11058/02/2008-AIS-III)

(HARISH C. RAI)
Desk Officer

The Gazette of Meghalaya
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

 No.19           Shillong,  Thursday,  October  15,  2009,      23rd  Asvina, 1931 (S. E.)

Postal Registration No. N. E.—771/2006-2008

PART - VII
GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA
ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

———
NOTIFICATION



Note – The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India vide notification number 158, dated the 14th
September, 1954 and subsequently amended vide notification number :-

Sl.No. G.S.R. No. Date

1 122 15.03.1958
2 765 06.09.1958
3 208 25.02.1961
4 1717 27.11.1965
5 1113 29.07.1967
6 1448 21.06.1969
7 1595 06.07.1969
8 49 09.01.1971
9 749 22.05.1971
10 22(E) 11.01.1972
11 933 05.08.1972
12 11 11.01.1975
13 137 01.02.1975
14 256 28.02.1976
15 429 27.03.1976
16 939 23.07.1977
17 938 23.07.1977
18 1431 29.10.1977
19 1185 30.09.1978
20 880 23.10.1982
21 770 21.07.1984
22 27.06.1988
23 194 24.09.1998
24 244 27.11.1998

(HARISH C. RAI)
Desk Officer.

D.  KHARPURI,
Under Secretary to the Govt. of Meghalaya,

Home (Police) Department.

THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA, OCTOBER 15, 2009218 [PART-VII


