
The Gazette of Meghalaya
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 51                Shillong,  Wednesday,  April  6,  2011,            16th  Chaitra,    1933  (S. E.)

PART - IV
GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA

LAW (B) DEPARTMENT

ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

———

Postal Registration No. N. E.—771/2006-2008

NOTIFICATION

The 6th April, 2011.

No.LL(B) 51/97/45.—The Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers Health
Protection (Repealing) Act, 2011 (Act No.12 of 2011) is hereby published for general information.

MEGHALAYA  ACT NO. 12 OF 2011.

(As passed by the Meghalaya Legislative Assembly)

Received the assent of the Governor on 6th April, 2011.

Published in the Gazette of Meghalaya Extra-Ordinary issue dated 6th April, 2011.

THE MEGHALAYA PROHIBITION OF SMOKING AND NON-SMOKERS HEALTH PROTECTION
(REPEALING) ACT, 2011.

AN

ACT

To repeal the Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers Health Protection Act, 1998.

Be enacted by the Legislature of the State of Meghalaya in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic
of India as follows :-

Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers
Health Protection (Repealing) Act, 2011.

Repeal. 2. The Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers Health Protection Act,
1998 is hereby repealed.

SHILLONG: Printed and  Published  by the Director,  Printing and  Stationery, Meghalaya, Shillong.
              (Extraordinary Gazette of Meghalaya) No.101-615+400—8-4-2011.

website:- http://megpns.gov.in/gazette/gazette.asp

L. M. SANGMA,

Secretary to the Government of Meghalaya,
Law Department.



NOTIFICATION

The 6th April, 2011.

No.LL(B)148/85/362.—The Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya (Member’s Pension)

(Amendment) Act, 2011 (Act No. 10 of 2011) is hereby published for general information.

.

MEGHALAYA  ACT NO. 10 OF 2011.

(As passed by the Meghalaya Legislative Assembly)

Received the assent of the Governor on 6th April, 2011.

Published in the Gazette of Meghalaya Extra-Ordinary issue dated 6th April, 2011.

The Gazette of Meghalaya
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

 No. 52              Shillong,   Wednesday,   April  6,  2011,            16th  Chaitra,   1933  (S. E.)

PART - IV

GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA

LAW (B) DEPARTMENT

ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

———

Postal Registration No. N. E.—771/2006-2008



THE  LEGISLATIVE  ASSEMBLY  OF  MEGHALAYA  (MEMBER’S  PENSION)
(AMENDMENT)  ACT,  2011

AN

ACT

further to amend the Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya (Members Pension) Act, 1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Meghalaya in the Sixty-second Year
of the Republic of India as follows, -

Short title and
commencement.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya
(Member’s Pension) Act, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force on the 1st April, 2011.

2. (1) In Section 3 (1) of the Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya
(Members  Pension’s) Act, 1977 as amended (hereinafter  referred
to as the Principal Act), for the words “five  thousand”, the words
“ten thousand” shall be substituted.

(2) In the second proviso to Section 3 (1), for the words “rupees
four hundred” the words “rupees one thousand” shall be substituted
and for the existing comma occurring in fifth line, the punctuation
“.” shall be substituted and thereafter the words “however that in
no case shall the total pension payable exceed rupees sixteen
thousand per mensem” shall be omitted.

3. In Section 3A of the Principal Act for the existing words “seven
hundred fifty”, the words “three thousand” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
Section 3 of Act
of 1977.

Amendment of
Section 3A of Act
of 1977.

694 [PART - IVTHE  GAZETTE  OF  MEGHALAYA, (EXTRAORDINARY)  APRIL 6,  2011

SHILLONG: Printed and  Published  by the Director,  Printing and  Stationery, Meghalaya, Shillong.
              (Extraordinary Gazette of Meghalaya) No.103-615+400—8-4-2011.

website:- http://megpns.gov.in/gazette/gazette.asp

L. M. SANGMA,
Secretary to the Government of Meghalaya,

Law Department.



NOTIFICATION

The 6th April, 2011.

No.LL(B) 131/2010/85.—The Meghalaya Infrastructure Development Finance Board

Act, 2011 (Act No. 11 of 2011) is hereby published for general information.

.

MEGHALAYA  ACT NO. 11 OF 2011.

(As passed by the Meghalaya Legislative Assembly)

Received the assent of the Governor on 6th April, 2011.

Published in the Gazette of Meghalaya Extra-Ordinary issue dated 6th April, 2011.

The Gazette of Meghalaya
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

 No. 53              Shillong,   Wednesday,   April  6,  2011,            16th  Chaitra,   1933  (S. E.)

PART - IV

GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA

LAW (B) DEPARTMENT

ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

———

Postal Registration No. N. E.—771/2006-2008



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV696

ACT,

AN

ACT



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 697



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV698



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 699



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV700



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 701



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV702



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 703



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV704



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 705



institutions,

Central

THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV706



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 707



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV708



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 709



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV710



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 711



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV712



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 713



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV714



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 715



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV716



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 717



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV718



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 719



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV720

SHILLONG: Printed and  Published  by the Director,  Printing and  Stationery, Meghalaya, Shillong.
              (Extraordinary Gazette of Meghalaya) No.105-615+400—8-4-2011.

website:- http://megpns.gov.in/gazette/gazette.asp

L. M. SANGMA,
Secretary to the Government of Meghalaya,

Law Department.



NOTIFICATION

The 6th April, 2011.

No.LL(B)148/85/362.—The Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya (Member’s Pension)

(Amendment) Act, 2011 (Act No. 10 of 2011) is hereby published for general information.

.

MEGHALAYA  ACT NO. 10 OF 2011.

(As passed by the Meghalaya Legislative Assembly)

Received the assent of the Governor on 6th April, 2011.

Published in the Gazette of Meghalaya Extra-Ordinary issue dated 6th April, 2011.

The Gazette of Meghalaya
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

 No. 52              Shillong,   Wednesday,   April  6,  2011,            16th  Chaitra,   1933  (S. E.)

PART - IV

GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA

LAW (B) DEPARTMENT

ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

———

Postal Registration No. N. E.—771/2006-2008



THE  LEGISLATIVE  ASSEMBLY  OF  MEGHALAYA  (MEMBER’S  PENSION)
(AMENDMENT)  ACT,  2011

AN

ACT

further to amend the Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya (Members Pension) Act, 1977.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Meghalaya in the Sixty-second Year
of the Republic of India as follows, -

Short title and
commencement.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya
(Member’s Pension) Act, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force on the 1st April, 2011.

2. (1) In Section 3 (1) of the Legislative Assembly of Meghalaya
(Members  Pension’s) Act, 1977 as amended (hereinafter  referred
to as the Principal Act), for the words “five  thousand”, the words
“ten thousand” shall be substituted.

(2) In the second proviso to Section 3 (1), for the words “rupees
four hundred” the words “rupees one thousand” shall be substituted
and for the existing comma occurring in fifth line, the punctuation
“.” shall be substituted and thereafter the words “however that in
no case shall the total pension payable exceed rupees sixteen
thousand per mensem” shall be omitted.

3. In Section 3A of the Principal Act for the existing words “seven
hundred fifty”, the words “three thousand” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
Section 3 of Act
of 1977.

Amendment of
Section 3A of Act
of 1977.

694 [PART - IVTHE  GAZETTE  OF  MEGHALAYA, (EXTRAORDINARY)  APRIL 6,  2011

SHILLONG: Printed and  Published  by the Director,  Printing and  Stationery, Meghalaya, Shillong.
              (Extraordinary Gazette of Meghalaya) No.103-615+400—8-4-2011.

website:- http://megpns.gov.in/gazette/gazette.asp

L. M. SANGMA,
Secretary to the Government of Meghalaya,

Law Department.



NOTIFICATION

The 6th April, 2011.

No.LL(B) 131/2010/85.—The Meghalaya Infrastructure Development Finance Board

Act, 2011 (Act No. 11 of 2011) is hereby published for general information.

.

MEGHALAYA  ACT NO. 11 OF 2011.

(As passed by the Meghalaya Legislative Assembly)

Received the assent of the Governor on 6th April, 2011.

Published in the Gazette of Meghalaya Extra-Ordinary issue dated 6th April, 2011.

The Gazette of Meghalaya
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

 No. 53              Shillong,   Wednesday,   April  6,  2011,            16th  Chaitra,   1933  (S. E.)

PART - IV

GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA

LAW (B) DEPARTMENT

ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

———

Postal Registration No. N. E.—771/2006-2008



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV696

ACT,

AN

ACT



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 697



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV698



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 699



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV700



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 701



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV702



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 703



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV704



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 705



institutions,

Central

THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV706



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 707



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV708



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 709



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV710



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 711



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV712



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 713



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV714



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 715



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV716



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 717



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV718



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011PART-IV] 719



THE GAZETTE OF MEGHALAYA  (EXTRAORDINARY) APRIL 6,  2011 [PART-IV720

SHILLONG: Printed and  Published  by the Director,  Printing and  Stationery, Meghalaya, Shillong.
              (Extraordinary Gazette of Meghalaya) No.105-615+400—8-4-2011.

website:- http://megpns.gov.in/gazette/gazette.asp

L. M. SANGMA,
Secretary to the Government of Meghalaya,

Law Department.



The Gazette of Meghalaya
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 51                Shillong,  Wednesday,  April  6,  2011,            16th  Chaitra,    1933  (S. E.)

PART - IV
GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA

LAW (B) DEPARTMENT

ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

———

Postal Registration No. N. E.—771/2006-2008

NOTIFICATION

The 6th April, 2011.

No.LL(B) 51/97/45.—The Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers Health
Protection (Repealing) Act, 2011 (Act No.12 of 2011) is hereby published for general information.

MEGHALAYA  ACT NO. 12 OF 2011.

(As passed by the Meghalaya Legislative Assembly)

Received the assent of the Governor on 6th April, 2011.

Published in the Gazette of Meghalaya Extra-Ordinary issue dated 6th April, 2011.

THE MEGHALAYA PROHIBITION OF SMOKING AND NON-SMOKERS HEALTH PROTECTION
(REPEALING) ACT, 2011.

AN

ACT

To repeal the Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers Health Protection Act, 1998.

Be enacted by the Legislature of the State of Meghalaya in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic
of India as follows :-

Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers
Health Protection (Repealing) Act, 2011.

Repeal. 2. The Meghalaya Prohibition of Smoking and Non-Smokers Health Protection Act,
1998 is hereby repealed.

SHILLONG: Printed and  Published  by the Director,  Printing and  Stationery, Meghalaya, Shillong.
              (Extraordinary Gazette of Meghalaya) No.101-615+400—8-4-2011.

website:- http://megpns.gov.in/gazette/gazette.asp

L. M. SANGMA,

Secretary to the Government of Meghalaya,
Law Department.




